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CosMedical Technologies Releases Age-Defying Skincare Starter Kit 

—Bestselling Medical-Grade Anti-Aging Regimen Now Available in Travel Size.— 
 
Davie, Florida (November 1, 2018)— CosMedical Technologies, a leading private label skincare provider 
worldwide, announced today the launch of their popular 3-step Age Reverse System in an all-new 
compact starter kit size.  
 
Now live on the company website, the Age Reverse System Starter Kit is an accessible introduction to 
the original product’s clinically-proven anti-aging benefits. The lower price point will allow patients a 
low-risk opportunity to become acquainted with the skincare line and familiarize themselves with the 
regimen. With 4 weeks’ supply of product, patients will be able to see the results on their skin and 
choose to invest in the full-sized product system. 
 
The dermatologist-developed system has performed well in clinical studies. After just 4 weeks of use, 
87% of patients saw improvement in lines and wrinkles, while 93% noticed an improvement in skin 
smoothness. Designed as a complete skincare regimen, the three-piece kit includes a Chamomile Facial 
Cleanser, a C-Stem® anti-aging serum, and an Ultra Benefits® moisturizer.  
 
 “Our Age Reverse System has become one of our flagship products, consistently ranking as a top seller 
across the board,” says Gina Ciraldo Stabile, CEO of CosMedical Technologies. “It visibly improves signs 
of age on the skin -- wrinkles, dark spots, uneven skin tone, coarse texture -- and boosts overall 
luminosity. Patients get noticeable results, fast. They love it.” 
 
The regimen includes key ingredients such as active marine peptides, brown algae extract, vitamin C, 
and powerful antioxidants such as Lipochroman® which is the strongest antioxidant on the market to 
protect from all three free radicals. Stabile states, “The products were formulated with concentrated 
medical-strength ingredients. They work in tandem to really replenish and rejuvenate your skin.” 
 
The Age Reverse System Starter Kit is available to existing customers through their CosMedical 
Technologies account executive. New accounts may contact the CosMedical Technologies sales team to 
place an order or make inquiries.  
 
About CosMedical Technologies®:  Founded in 1993 by board-certified dermatologist Loretta Ciraldo, 
M.D., FAAD, CosMedical Technologies provides custom label skin care to licensed professionals around 
the world. A forerunner in the private-label skincare industry, CosMedical Technologies is known for 
staying ahead of emerging industry trends, offering a wide range of dermatologist-developed formulas 
created with advanced ingredients and innovative technology. Visit CosMedical Technologies online at 
cosmedicaltechnologies.com for more information.   
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